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Abstract 

Background: Mental health and physical health issues frequently co-occur, but the impact of the 
psychological wellbeing on the body’s physical functioning remains poorly understood within 
medical spaces. Individuals living with psychiatric diagnoses in particular are at an increased risk 
for developing chronic health issues and may be especially disadvantaged by healthcare systems 
which treat the mind and body as separate entities.  
Methods: We analyzed 30 semi-structured interviews of individuals living with a serious mental 
illness or reflecting on a family member living with a serious mental illness. We deliberately 
sampled participants who reflected on salient experiences with co-occurring physical and mental 
health symptoms. All participants were associated with the National Alliance on Mental Illness 
(NAMI), the nation’s largest grassroots mental health organization. We coded interviews using 
qualitative thematic analysis with an interpretative phenomenological framework centered on 
participants’ subjective experiences.  
Results: Our analyses uncovered physical health challenges which often occur in individuals 
living with a psychiatric illness, emphasizing the bidirectionality of mental and physical 
symptoms. We identified three overarching domains: (i) manifestations, in which participants 
reflected on how their body responded physically to mental states; (ii) medical management, in 
which they discussed challenging experiences seeking medical treatment for physical symptoms 
while living with a mental health condition; and (iii) disjointedness, in which they reflected on 
challenges in navigating poorly coordinated mental and physical healthcare systems.  
Discussion: Participants and their medical providers struggled to incorporate mental wellbeing 
and its impact on physical health into overall healthcare. Given common experiences with 
misdiagnoses, difficulties navigating health care, and significantly delayed treatment, medical 
spaces may be able to improve patient experiences and satisfaction by accounting for 
psychological influences on health outcomes.  
Conclusions: Greater integration of physical and mental health care in medical spaces could 
improve health outcomes and reduce challenges for patients seeking treatment.  
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There is no real difference between space, or internal place, and 

the corporeal substance contained in it. The only difference lies in 

the way in which we are accustomed to conceive of them.  

— Descartes 

 

 
Mental illness can reliably increase the risk for the development of physical illness, which can in 
turn translate into decreased life expectancies (Link et al., 2017). Indeed, the World Health 
Organization has estimated that people with serious mental illness (SMI) have a 10- to 25-year 
reduction in life expectancy (Plana-Ripol et al., 2019). Chronic health problems are common in 
patients with severe mental illnesses, partly related to reduced exercise, adverse effects of 
psychotropic medication use, and poor services and monitoring (Jones et al., 2004; Robson & 
Gray, 2007). Effects of psychotropic medication, which range from poor dental health to sexual 
dysfunction, to difficulties with physical activity, may seriously complicate physical health 
outcomes in subjects with SMI (Robson & Gray, 2007). Unfortunately, the physical health of 
patients with SMI is frequently overlooked, resulting in a lack of recording, monitoring, and 
assessment for a population that is already vulnerable to poor health outcomes (Robson & Gray, 
2007).  
 
Delineating the causes of physical health issues in patients with SMI is complex and affected by 
a mix of factors, contributing to service barriers (Robson & Gray, 2007). Various biological, 
social, and psychological factors have the propensity to impact both mental and physical health 
symptoms. For example, medically unexplained symptoms (MUS) are overlapping and poorly 
understood conditions that often present as a congregation of somatic symptoms, a result of 
intersecting biological and psychological factors (Balabanovic et al., 2020; Escobar et al., 2002). 
In a 2015 study, MUS were estimated to cost the United States $256 billion annually in medical 
costs (Evens et al., 2015). These symptoms frequently co-occur with psychiatric disorders and 
can be distressing and invalidate the patient’s experience, given their being poorly understood 
medically (Balabanovic et al., 2020; Van Sluijs et al., 2015). Symptoms that cannot be explained 
medically often strain the general practitioner-patient relationship and reduce trust in the 
structure and function of health systems (Balabanovic et al., 2020).  
 
Symptoms that surface after exposure to traumatic events can be similarly opaque and be 
classified as MUS (Escobar et al., 2002). Environmental stressors such as trauma, exposure to 
environmental toxins, or lack of control in the workplace can all impact physical health and 
contribute to these symptoms (Banyard et al., 2017; Escobar et al., 2002; Nelson et al., 2012; 
Nicolaidis et al., 2003). The surfacing of mental and physical symptoms in the wake of traumatic 
events may in part be understood through embodiment—environmental events triggering 
impairments in biological systems inherent to the physiologic response to stress, which can 
contribute to the embedding of negative patterns of thinking (Luyten & Fonagy, 2020).  
 
The significant overlap between mental and physical health is not unique to specific disorders, 
but applicable across health conditions (Nielsen et al., 2020). And yet, such an intersection 
presents challenges to the medical management of concurrent physical and mental symptoms 
with no clear etiology. These difficulties take several forms: First, there is a muddled cause-
effect relationship that can contribute to medical uncertainty, wherein it is difficult to pinpoint 



 

whether emotional distress causes somatic symptoms or the reverse is true (Bransfield, 2019). 
Second, management of co-occurring physical illness and mental health disorders is often 
suboptimal, given that dealing with the complexity of both can be daunting (Van Sluijs et al., 
2015). This may in part be attributed to division of labor within medical specialties, wherein 
medical professionals often operate homogeneously within their segment of the profession, thus 
reducing their own uncertainty but causing more subtle aspects of care to be overlooked or 
diverted to other specialists (Bucher & Strauss, 1961; Light, 1980). Third, diagnostic 
overshadowing is common in patients with SMI, wherein an individual’s physical symptoms are 
treated solely as a reflection of their psychiatric diagnosis, resulting in barriers to proper care 
(Happell et al., 2016). Finally, because mental illness labels and the stigma associated with them 
commonly call into question the validity of symptoms, patients often report difficulty in getting 
routine health assessments and physical health issues being dismissed by care providers (Happell 
et al., 2016; Pescosolido et al., 2013).  
 
There is a need to consider mental and physical health as bidirectional and integrated. The 
disconnect between psychiatric and medical systems creates a false dichotomy in which mind 
and body are conceptualized as separate entities (Balabanovic et al., 2020). This represents a 
critical gap, as most healthcare providers lack simultaneous specialization or expertise in both 
areas (Bransfield, 2019; van Hasselt et al., 2013). Minimal collaboration between primary and 
mental health care presents a burden for patients who may have to repeat assessments 
unnecessarily, are misinformed, or unsure as to which type of professional to consult for care 
(van Hasselt et al., 2013).  
 
In this qualitative study we explore the contemporaneous manifestation of physical symptoms in 
patients with mental health conditions, and their subsequent experiences with medical care.  
 
 
METHODS 

 

Design and data collection 

 

For this qualitative study, we used semi-structured interviews to gather participant information. 
Semi-structured interviews are a well-established method for exploring opinions and perceptions 
of individuals surrounding sensitive topics, as well as for probing ideas from samples with varied 
backgrounds and histories (Barriball & While, 1994). One of the authors (KD) conducted the 
interviews over several months as part of a larger project with the National Alliance on Mental 
Illness (NAMI), the world’s largest grassroots mental health organization, dedicated to 
improving the lives of Americans living with mental illness. The semi-structured interviews were 
geared towards discussing participants’ experiences and perceptions of living with mental illness, 
and their narratives surrounding the recovery process. All interviews took place online and were 
transcribed verbatim. We de-identified all transcripts which were then uploaded into NVivo (ISR 
International, Melbourne), a qualitative analysis software used for computerized support and 
organization of qualitative analysis.  
 

Participants  



 

All participants in our sample are living with a mental illness, or reflected on a person close to 
them living with one. Having both personal and familial reflections on mental illness experiences 
allowed us to paint a more holistic picture of living with mental illness. The total sample was 
composed of 118 participants, a small number of whom were interviewed jointly given their 
relationships (siblings, parent and child, or romantic partnership). We deliberately sampled 30 
individuals for this qualitative study from the overall sample obtained for NAMI. This study 
focused on this particular subsample given their recounting of salient experiences with 
overlapping physical and psychiatric symptomatology during interviews. Information power, a 
concept used to guide sufficient sample sizes for qualitative work, posits that fewer participants 
are needed to conduct quality qualitative research when these participants hold more quality 
information relevant to the study’s purposes (Malterud et al., 2016). Our narrow study aim, the 
specificity of experience and knowledge of our participants, and the high quality of dialogue 
collected via interviews, all contribute to the information power of our study (Malterud et al., 
2016). Our working sample included 19 females and 11 males; 24 self-identified as white, four 
as Black or African American, one as Asian American or Pacific Islander, and one as Latinx.  

 
We obtained ethics approval from the Yale University Institutional Review Board (HIC # 

2000031331. Participants provided written informed consent as part of the larger project under 
NAMI, but written consent for this secondary and de-identified study waived by the IRB. 
Moreover, any potentially identifying information has been excluded from the results.  

 
Data Analysis 

We coded interviews using the principles of thematic analysis, a method that can be used to 
reveal complex, textured, and rich descriptions of collected data (Kiger & Carpio, 2020). We 
followed the 6-step approach to inductive thematic analysis developed by Braun and Clark 
(2006). In this effort, we used interpretative phenomenological analysis (IPA) as a theoretical 
approach centered on the subjective experiences of participants (Hefferon and Gil-Rodriguez, 
2011; Smith and Flowers, 2009). Two authors (GS, KS) reviewed and coded interviews 
independently toward generating themes. We selected quotes for analysis by reviewing identified 
themes which related to our area of interest in the data. Additionally, and to ensure all relevant 
experiences were taken into account for our analysis, we conducted a text-search within NVivo 
of all interviews for keywords which may likely have been used to describe salient experiences 
with co-occurring physical symptoms and mental health conditions (e.g., “body”). At several 
time points across the coding process, all authors met to discuss, review, and triangulate codes 
and themes toward a final codebook. This process resulted in theoretical sufficiency, wherein 
additional data would not generate new themes, but rather be subsumed within already defined 
themes (Saunders et al., 2018).  
 

 

RESULTS 

 

We developed three overarching domains, each with underlying themes and subthemes. The first 
domain, manifestations, explores how physical functioning may be affected by mental health 
conditions and underlying psychological influences. The second, medical management, discusses 
the experiences of individuals with concurrent mental and physical health issues, aiming to 
expose potential gaps in care. The final domain, disjointedness, addresses the benefits of 



 

considering mind and body as intrinsically intertwined, and the implications of such a synthetic 
conceptualization on medical spaces and the patient care provided within them. 
 

INSERT TABLE 1 HERE 

 

1. Manifestations 

All participants in our sample had either personal or familial experience with mental illness; 
many experienced concurrent disruptions in physical functioning. Often, participants reflected on 
physical symptoms with worry or confusion, unsure of the underlying cause. This section and the 
next follow the stories of several individuals, each assigned an alphabetically consecutive 
pseudonym. The following two sections include complementary quotations from other 
participants, as the experiences of our three index individuals were prominently reflected across 
the overall sample.  
 

Physical conditions can be missed in the context of mental illness 

The body can respond physically to mental states and mental symptoms can be manifested 
bodily. ‘Andrew’, who struggles with anxiety, noticed from a young age how his body responds 
to the world around him. In the fifth grade, he experienced what he now presumes to be his first 
anxiety attack, which for him was characterized by sensory overload and feelings of his 
classroom walls closing in. These challenges with sensory stimulation continued into high school 
as well:  
  

My body has always reacted to my anxiety. I’ve gotten weird manifestations in my body. 
 

His first experience with an anxiety attack was one of overwhelming terror. Later 
diagnosed with an anxiety disorder, Andrew went on to understand how his body reflects 
subjective tension and stress. Similarly, bodily manifestations could be frightening for 
participants, who were most often struggling with primarily mental, rather than physical health 
conditions. Such physical responses exemplify how mental wellbeing does not exist in a vacuum, 
and that conceptualizing it that way may only result in confusion for patients.  

Not everyone, and perhaps not even most, have Andrew’s insight. Some experiences 
highlight the overlap between physical and mental health disruptions that may lead to challenges 
when seeking treatment. ‘Beth’, for example, has a daughter who struggles with serious mental 
illness as well as a husband with what she described as somewhat ‘minor’ challenges with 
depression. In discussing how she communicated the family’s complex mental illness history to 
her daughter, Beth reflected on a confusing experience with her husband:  
 

[W]e didn’t realize at the time, [and] for several years, [that he] had had panic attacks. But every 
time he did, it was like he was having a heart attack and we’d go to the hospital because we 
thought it was his heart. 

  
 Though it was eventually discovered that Beth’s husband was dealing with a 
predominantly psychiatric diagnosis, both Beth and the doctors had inferred a physical ailment as 
the culprit. More broadly, participants struggled to distinguish between physical and mental 
causes of different physical manifestations. Sometimes, these manifestations were complete 
mysteries—stumping doctor and patient alike.  



 

Disruptions in health of unknown etiology may pose a particular challenge to the 
wellbeing and timely treatment of patients. ‘Chloe’, an Asian American woman in her early 
twenties, reflected on her diagnoses of bipolar and post-traumatic stress disorders, and on her 
practice of various self-care methods as a means of adapting to a lack of understanding by her 
healthcare providers. Beginning in her teenage years, Chloe was episodically and painfully blind:  
 

I was diagnosed with glaucoma when I was 14. And I was told it was this inflammation of the 
eyes that would basically increase my eye pressure. And so, it popped my eyes blank, basically… 

 

 Chloe had a diagnosis of bipolar disorder by then, but the underlying cause of her visual 
condition remained elusive. Unlike Beth’s husband’s symptoms, the manifestation of Chloe’s 
visual symptoms were rare within the medical spaces she was seen in. Clinicians must think 
creatively about the connection between physical and mental diagnoses in order to treat patients 
most effectively, keeping in mind that our understanding of the mind-body connection is still 
rudimentary. After explaining her condition, Chloe reflected back on the challenges she faced in 
accessing care: systemically, cross-culturally, and relating to the stigma associated with engaging 
clinically with her mental illness. 
 
The body can respond physically to mental states   
Certain bodily symptoms are well known to be linked to mental health. In ‘Dana’s’ words, 
 

I was just overwhelmed a lot. I started to have some stomach problems, which were linked to 
stress, so…I went to GI doctors for years. I had really bad acid reflux and I had irritable bowel 
syndrome, which are two anxious-people conditions. 

 

 Irritable bowel syndrome (IBS) is a good example of a diagnosis that once posed a 
mysterious challenge to doctors. IBS has since been identified as tightly correlated with 
psychological and mental functioning; physicians are now better equipped to apply an integrated 
understanding of both mind and body to treat patients more effectively. This participant was one 
of the few within the sample able to identify how her physical symptoms were inextricably 
linked to her mental ones of anxiety.  
In some cases, participants recognized the lasting impact that untreated mental health conditions 
can have on the body. ‘Elaine’ spoke of witnessing her mother develop breast cancer while 
struggling with substance addiction, which she considers masked the diagnosis of the 
malignancy:  
 

When you're in the state of addiction, your physical health beyond kind of satiating that chemical 
dependence really is not top of mind. And so, I think it was a year or maybe two years of this 
developing cancer that she was completely unaware of…This is something that really has been 
replicated throughout rural areas, folks who have really unaddressed physical illnesses as a result 
of addiction and unchecked mental illness that really just, I think, snowballs into something that 
is really irreversible to a certain time. 

 

 Even as this participant reflected back on her first-hand experience, she also noted the 
impact of unchecked mental illness on her broader community. Mental illness can manifest 
through symptoms and disrupted functioning that mask underlying physical illness.  
 



 

2. Medical Management 

Participants often consulted medical spaces in the pursuit of healing and understanding their 
physical symptoms. However, their symptoms were often met with uncertainty or incorrect 
diagnoses and treatments, delaying healing and consuming valuable time and resources. This 
section will discuss the medical management of the symptoms of Andrew, Beth, and Chloe, as 
well as provide reflections from other participants on their experiences with treatment of 
concurrent mental and physical illness in medical spaces.  
 
Physical symptoms can provide a facile explanation 

Andrew reflected back on his childhood diagnosis of pleurisy, the dated term for an 
inflammation of the pleura, the thin covering of the lungs. The physician mistook Andrew’s 
body’s responses to anxiety for a physical condition, medicating him accordingly. In a medical 
space, it was not intuitive that his physical symptoms could have arisen from a primary 
psychiatric condition: 
 

I don’t remember what led up to it, but I know I was taking medication for pleurisy, the doctor 
thought I had pleurisy. I’m not sure what type, it was anti-inflammatory I think maybe.  

 

 Beth’s journey through medical care with her husband was similar. Her husband suffered 
from what initially appeared to be from chest pain portending heart attacks, thus prompting them 
to frequent the hospital’s emergency room. She reflected on their experiences seeking treatment 
in medical spaces:  
 

[H]e had a heart murmur and they would run tests and they would do caths and send him home. 
And so, we didn’t realize that all those were panic attacks or that there was anything wrong with 
him. 

 

 In light of the medical team’s approach to her husband’s symptoms, Beth remained 
unaware of what her husband was suffering from. This was as emotionally consuming for Beth 
and her husband as it was costly for the medical system and its limited resources. Interestingly, 
Beth stated that they were unsure anything was ‘wrong with’ her husband—evidence of how 
entrenched mental health stigma can affect the perception of doctors and patients alike, as though 
what happens within the body is more legitimate or ‘real’ than what happens in the mind.  

Doctors used a variety of resources in an attempt to crack Chloe’s case as well. 
Diagnosed with bipolar disorder, she experienced episodic blindness attributed to any number of 
elusive ophthalmologic diagnoses: 

 
So, it turns out, actually, many years later, because I did hundreds of tests and went to all these 
specialists, and nobody could figure out what the heck was causing it. And it turned out that it’s 
most likely psychosomatic, because, after I finally got into a good mental health regimen, started 
seeing a therapist and got my medication, that’s also where the eye episodes [finally] stopped. 

 

 After consulting several medical doctors and enduring a wide range of medical testing, 
Chloe’s symptoms, previously attributed to an early (mis)diagnosis of glaucoma, resolved once 
she found adequate treatment for her mental health conditions. During her interview, Chloe said 
that she has now been episode-free for over three years. However, she noted that physical 
healthcare was much better structured than mental healthcare, and that she struggled with 



 

understanding treatment options, finding specialists, and experiencing cultural stigma in mental 
but not in physical health spaces. Even though Chloe’s physical healthcare was superior to that 
for her mental health, treatment could have been more efficient to navigate had the physical 
health spaces she visited placed greater importance on psychological influences on health from 
the outset. 
 
Medical providers can effectively incorporate mental wellbeing into treatment 

Andrew, Beth, and Chloe were misdiagnosed and overzealously tested without much initial 
consideration of their mental health. But some participants had a more integrated experience. 
‘Frida’ explained her visit to the doctor’s office after struggling with strong emotional symptoms 
and losing her desire to eat:  
 

Originally, they tested my thyroid because I come from a family that has I think 
hyperthyroidism…I went, they checked my thyroid levels. I believe they did blood work. They 
were looking at what I was eating and everything. And my doctor was kind of like, everything is 
coming back normal. Blood work is fine, your thyroid is fine. So once she kind of canceled out 
any physical elements that maybe would link to it, then she recommended and referred me to a 
psychiatrist.  

 

After having several medical tests show normal results, Frida’s primary care physician 
was able to refer her to a psychiatrist, where she was promptly diagnosed and treated for major 
depressive and generalized anxiety disorders. As in Chloe’s case, it was after properly addressing 
her mental health that she finally began to see improvement in her symptoms. Because of her 
clinician’s knowledge of psychological influences on health and their referral to a mental health 
specialist, Frida was able to readily access the treatment she needed.  

In turn, ‘Gina’ spoke about her mental health causing physical symptoms, which 
prompted her doctor to point out psychological and environmental influences potentially 
affecting her health:  
  

I was getting anxiety in my throat, palpitations, I couldn't figure it out, my blood pressure was 
fluctuating. Then the good thing about it, what I liked about the doctor was that he was an African 
American male, and so we were able to talk about the issues of race in America…and so we were 
able to drill down to what's really going on and talk about my childhood, about how race played 
into my education at school, at my public school, how race played into the media and the news 
and my perception of myself, how race played into my workforce experience. And I was like 
damn, race made a big deal and contributed to my mental health. 

 

It is critical to understand the far-reaching effects of the outside world on health 
symptomatology and wellbeing, mental as well as physical. While Gina’s body was showing 
symptoms, her healing required a medical system informed by larger issues such as systemic 
racism. Additionally, her doctor’s identity as an African American man allowed for a productive 
conversation regarding her experiences and how those formative and ongoing experiences would 
be likely to affect her health.       
 

 

3. Disjointedness  

Participants in our sample struggled to receive treatment that considered and addressed their 
whole personhood. All too often, treatments were disconnected, treating the mind or the body but 



 

seldom both. Participants' mental health not only interfered with their physical wellbeing, but 
also affected the quality of their treatment. This section will discuss participants perceptions of 
and challenges with the medical system. In this third and final overarching domain we discuss 
how having a mental illness affects interpretations of physical illness, and the burdens placed on 
patients by having to navigate separate mental health and physical health systems.  
 

Mental illness can delegitimize the experience and treatment of physical illness 

Mental illness is highly stigmatized, including in medical spaces. This reality can affect the 
quality of care that patients with a diagnosed mental illness are able to receive, even when that 
care is related to physical well-being. Several participants reflected on the systemic barriers they 
encountered in medicine. ‘Henry’ suggested how mental illness should be responded to and 
proposed an idea regarding why mental illness diagnosis may create barriers to care:  
 

My first thing is to say, "Tell me how you would respond if a person has suffered from liver 
disease, or heart disease, or any other illness, how would you react? It should be no different than 
the person with mental illness." Now, the issue is folks can't see the manifestation of mental 
illness, so it's somewhat of a surprise to them when one has an episode. How they cope with that, 
how do they keep the person safe, what they may do is difficult because the system is broken. 

 

Henry, along with several others, conceptualized mental illness as a brain disease that 
should not be treated differently from any other organic illness. He noted that one of the primary 
reasons for a mental illness diagnosis to elicit a subpar treatment is because mental illness may 
be less noticeable to the eye, and by extension be interpreted as less real. He also echoes a 
sentiment held by many participants in the broader sample: the system is broken and needs 
change.  

Discussing providing a mental health training for nursing students, ‘Iris’ talked about 
how a diagnosis can affect treatment in medicine:    
 

Because I had had experiences in hospitals where as soon as they hear there's a mental health 
condition, they disregard anything physical you have come to the hospital for… I think the 
biggest thing for them was that [the training] humanized [mental health] for them because so 
many people are just a name on a medical file and that humanized what mental health was all 
about.  

 

Iris, previously diagnosed with bipolar disorder herself, initially reflected back on her 
own physical health being overlooked in hospitals. Like most other participants, she is using her 
own challenges navigating the health system to motivate improvements that might benefit others. 
She viewed improved treatment of psychiatric patients—herself included—as a way to move 
towards humanization and destigmatization in medicine.  
  
Separate mental and physical health treatment settings pose a challenge for all patients  

Physical and mental wellbeing are deeply integrated, and treatment spaces that consider physical 
or mental health in isolation may not be treating the whole patient. Patients would likely benefit 
from more interdisciplinary thinking and greater consideration of the overlaps between physical 
and mental health. ‘Jenna’ commented on why she feels practitioners are unable to more deeply 
address mental influences on health:  
  



 

Physicians don't have the time to cover all of the stuff that they could do with mental health. With 
them they're trying to check to make sure that you're still healthy with physical stuff and bodily 
things and stuff like that. They don't have enough time to cover both subjects. 

 

 Jenna expressed her concern in the context of a legislative change she was in the process 
of advocating for in her home state—making insurance cover not just physical wellness visits, 
but those for mental wellness as well. Her comment reflects a more systemic issue, the current 
lack of time, resources, or will to assess mental wellbeing within general practice. Unfortunately, 
general practice is where patients often consult practitioners regarding physical symptoms, 
among them those that arise from, or are modified by problems in their mental health.  
 ‘Katja’ talked about seeking treatment for her son, diagnosed with schizoaffective 
disorder. She encountered significant challenges after having to consult various medical 
specialists, all of whom failed to treat him as a whole person:  
 

That is actually why we started flying to New York, because none of the psychiatrists would treat 
the whole body. They only want to prescribe an antipsychotic. Then you go to your family doctor 
and they say, "I'm sorry, you need to go back to your psychiatrist." …And our family doctor 
would not give him blood pressure medicine. He kept saying it was part of his psychosis. So all 
the other doctors, besides the psychiatrist, want to blame everything on the mental illness and not 
treat it. So you have all of these patients that have bipolar or schizophrenia or whatever, and 
they're only getting the anti-psychotic or the antidepressant and everything else is neglected.  

 
 Katja struggled accessing necessary treatment for her son in both psychiatric and general 
family medical care due to a lack of understanding and collaboration across specialties. She and 
her son had to travel for treatment, fight to receive necessary medication, and experience denial 
of his symptomatology because of his mental illness. A lack of understanding regarding how 
mental health affects physical health in medical spaces can create a tiring and burdensome path 
to recovery for patients. Participants’ reflections in this final domain reveal the gap in 
incorporating into care the deep integration and overlap of mental and physical wellbeing.  
 
 

DISCUSSION 

 

By analyzing interviews of patients living with psychiatric diagnoses, we uncovered physical 
health challenges that frequently occur in this group. We identified three key domains: 
manifestations, medical management, and disjointedness. By following the stories of three 
participants and interweaving the experiences of several others, we underscore how psychiatric 
symptoms can manifest physically, resulting in medical mismanagement of underlying 
conditions. These results highlight the bidirectional nature of physical and mental wellbeing and 
generate implications for a more seamlessly enmeshed, collaborative approach to treatment in 
medical spaces. 
 
Environmental and societal factors may have contributed to the overlap in participants' mental 
and physical health symptoms. The co-occurrence of mental and physical health disruptions may 
be impacted by the socio-economic costs of living with a mental health disorder, environmental 
stressors that affect both the brain and the body, including psychiatric medication side effect 
burden, which can cause deleterious metabolic outcomes (Bransfield et al., 2019; Robson & 



 

Gray, 2007). Adverse events in childhood have been shown to pose a lifelong burden on physical 
health and subsequent quality of life, revealing the intersection between mental and physical 
health across the lifespan (Banyard et al., 2017). Violence exposure has also been proven to 
cause lasting changes in neuroendocrine and central nervous system function, which can in turn 
contribute to a range of medically unexplained conditions and chronic physical symptoms 
(Nelson et al., 2012; Nicolaidis et al., 2003). Additionally, a recent meta-analysis identified 
growing evidence linking experiences with discrimination to greater distress and depressive 
symptoms (Williams et al., 2019). Racial discrimination is associated with poorer physical health 
outcomes across several axes, with notable increases in cardiovascular disease, incidence of 
obesity, and markers of inflammation, among others (Paradies et al., 2015; Williams et al., 
2019). Experiencing racism also increases odds of low trust in health care systems and reduces 
satisfaction in the patient-provider relationship (Williams et al., 2019). Cultural 
conceptualizations of mental illness, which are particularly influential from the West, can also 
affect not only prioritization of symptoms and course of healing, but also the illness itself 
(Waters, 2010). 
 
Interwoven in several of our findings were experiences of stigmatization as a result of mental 
health status. It has been suggested that stigma in itself may strongly contribute to the physical 
health disparities seen in individuals with mental illnesses (Link et al., 2017). As such, 
stigmatization may be another factor contributing to the prevalence of co-occurring mental and 
physical health conditions. To tackle these physical health disparities in patients with mental 
illness, several prior pieces of literature have suggested more integrated and collaborative health 
care (Balabanovic et al., 2020; Bransfield et al., 2019; De Hert et al., 2011; Happell et al., 2016; 
Robson & Gray, 2007). In many cases, participants reverted to physical explanations of their 
symptoms, which may have been driven by a desire to be protected from mental health stigma or 
to protect a sense of self (Balabanovic et al., 2020). Challenges to navigate the healthcare system 
and to receive proper care as a consequence of a mental health diagnosis may induce patients to 
lose faith in the healthcare system and opt to avoid it. Reducing the dualistic nature of physical 
and mental health care has the potential to ease the treatment-seeking process for those with 
coincident mental health and physical health symptomatology. Findings from our sample 
evidence current obstacles for patients with concurrent challenges because of a dualistic and 
balkanized healthcare system.  
 
After the onset of challenges with their physical health, our participants often showed feelings of 
confusion and frustration surrounding their symptoms’ origin, which were not well mitigated by 
consulting medical spaces. Participants in other samples have also expressed the burdensome 
nature of repeated assessments due to the lack of collaboration between providers, akin to the 
experiences of some individuals in our sample (Hasselt et al., 2013). Our results primarily reflect 
the perspectives of patients rather than of medical providers, but providers’ similar confusion in 
response to our participants’ physical symptoms was also apparent. Diagnoses that overlap 
psychiatric and general medicine are muddled and may have affected the diagnostic errors 
experienced by some of our participants. Due to the lack of clarity surrounding which provider is 
responsible for treating what overlapping symptom constellation, persons with mental health 
disorders may have their physical health overlooked and under-monitored (Robson & Gray, 
2007).  
 



 

Greater collaboration across health specialties could improve the integration of psychological 
influences on health into medical care—though this may require pushing back on traditional 
structures and roles (Balabanovic et al., 2020). For example, it may be necessary to push back on 
division of labor within medical specialties, thus encouraging medical professionals to operate in 
novel segments of the profession, embrace uncertainty, and adopt new skills in order to 
appreciate the complexity of diagnosis and treatment (Bucher & Strauss, 1961; Light, 1980). 
There is evidence of psychological therapy resulting in improvements in syndromes that seemed 
untreatable by general medicine alone. MUS are often treated using cognitive behavioral therapy 
(CBT) or Dynamic Interpersonal Therapy (DIT), which recognize the emotional and relational 
components of these symptoms (Balabanovic et al., 2020). Being knowledgeable about one’s 
diagnosis can create a sense of control and hope, and is a process that may be improved through 
the integration of psychological principles (Perkins et al., 2018). The absence of coordinated and 
well-integrated physical and mental health care represents a critical gap to optimal treatment and 
services for this population (De Hert et al., 2011).  
 
The practice of clinical general medicine and psychiatry could both improve their treatment 
outcomes by developing education initiatives addressing barriers to care identified by our 
participants. These include stigmatization, discrimination, and lack of knowledge regarding the 
interconnectedness of mind and body. Medical spaces should have adequate capacity to allow 
patients with mental illness to access necessary prevention, screening, and treatment of their 
physical health (De Hert et al., 2011). Future research should examine the perspective of persons 
working in different areas of care and administration in medical spaces. Investigating barriers to 
proper care by integrating the perspectives of patients such as those in this study, and by medical 
providers from future work, could allow for a more nuanced examination of, and reduction in 
barriers to optimal physical healthcare for individuals with mental illness.  
 
Limitations 

 

Our study has several noteworthy limitations. First, a review of the literature shows that patients 
may be resistant to psychological explanations of their physical symptoms. Medically-based 
explanations are often more convenient and desirable to patient and physician alike, which may 
limit the generalizability of our findings to patients without a preexisting psychiatric diagnosis 
(Escobar et al., 2002). Other qualitative work has shown that psychological illness explanations 
can feel dismissive and stigmatizing and leave individuals feeling ashamed or disbelieved 
(Balabanovic et al., 2020; Nielsen et al., 2020).  
 Second, our study pulled from semi-structured interviews on mental illness and recovery 
broadly defined (given that data came from interviews for a separate project), rather than on 
specifically inquired experiences with concurrent physical health issues. Given this focus, the 
stories shared by participants of their physical health and medical care challenges may only 
represent highly salient memories, and many important challenges may not have been picked up 
by these interviews. However, participants’ reflecting on their health challenges despite this not 
being the primary focus of interviews, reiterates the salience of these experiences for individuals 
living with mental illness.  
 Finally, our interviews did not include the complementary views of providers, which are 
critically important for designing feasible approaches to improving care in medical spaces.  
 



 

Conclusion 

 
By using thematic analysis of thirty semi-structured interviews, we uncovered salient 
experiences of medically unexplained symptoms and physical illness in a sample of participants 
reflecting on their mental illnesses. We divided reflections into three domains:  manifestations of 
psychiatric illness as physical symptoms; medical management of those coincident symptoms; 
and the disjointed nature of medical spaces catering separately to physical and mental health 
needs. Our findings emphasize the significant role of mental wellbeing in patient-centered care 
and optimal physical health outcomes—a role that is poorly understood by both patients and 
medical providers. Expanding training and education opportunities regarding psychological 
influences on health, and promoting a more seamless collaboration between medicine and 
psychiatry may enhance proper treatment for patients with overlapping health issues.  
 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

  



 

REFERENCES 

Acolin, J. (2019). Towards a clinical theory of embodiment: A model for the conceptualization 
and treatment of mental illness. The Routledge International Handbook of Embodied 
Perspectives in Psychotherapy: Approaches from Dance Movement and Body 
Psychotherapies, 40–52. https://doi.org/10.4324/9781315159416 

Balabanovic, J., & Hayton, P. (2020). Engaging patients with “medically unexplained 
symptoms” in psychological therapy: An integrative and transdiagnostic approach. 
Psychology and Psychotherapy: Theory, Research and Practice, 93(2), 347–366. 
https://doi.org/10.1111/papt.12213 

Banyard, V., Hamby, S., & Grych, J. (2017). Health effects of adverse childhood events: 
Identifying promising protective factors at the intersection of mental and physical well-being. 
Child Abuse and Neglect, 65, 88–98. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.chiabu.2017.01.011 

Barriball, K. L., & While, A. (1994). Collecting data using a semi-structured interview: a 
discussion paper. Journal of advanced nursing, 19(2), 328–335. 
https://doi.org/10.1111/j.1365-2648.1994.tb01088.x 

Bernstein, E. E., Rabideau, D. J., Gigler, M. E., Nierenberg, A. A., Deckersbach, T., & Sylvia, L. 
G. (2016). Patient perceptions of physical health and bipolar symptoms: The intersection of 
mental and physical health. Journal of Affective Disorders, 189, 203–206. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jad.2015.09.052 

Bransfield, R. C. (2019). Multisystem Illnesses and Medical Uncertainty. Healthcare, 7(114), 1–
28. 

Braun, V., & Clarke, V. (2006). Using thematic analysis in psychology. Qualitative Research in 

Psychology, 3(2), 77–101. https://doi.org/10.1191/1478088706qp063oa 

Bucher, R., & Strauss, A. (1961). Professions in Process. American Journal of Sociology, 66(4), 
325–334. http://www.jstor.org/stable/2773729 

Creed, F. (2009). Medically unexplained symptoms-blurring the line between “mental” and 
“physical” in somatoform disorders. Journal of Psychosomatic Research, 67(3), 185–187. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jpsychores.2009.07.001 

De Hert, M., Cohen, D., Bobes, J., Cetkovich-Bakmas, M., Leucht, S., Ndetei, D. M., 
Newcomer, J. W., Uwakwe, R., Asai, I., Möller, H. J., Gautam, S., Detraux, J., & Correll, C. 
U. (2011). Physical illness in patients with severe mental disorders. II. Barriers to care, 
monitoring and treatment guidelines, plus recommendations at the system and individual 
level. World psychiatry : official journal of the World Psychiatric Association (WPA), 10(2), 
138–151. https://doi.org/10.1002/j.2051-5545.2011.tb00036.x 

Escobar, J. I., Hoyos-Nervi, C., & Gara, M. (2002). Medically unexplained physical symptoms 
in medical practice: a psychiatric perspective. Environmental Health Perspectives, 110 Suppl 
4, 631–636. https://doi.org/10.1289/ehp.02110s4631 

Evens, A., Vendetta, L., Krebs, K., & Herath, P. (2015). Medically unexplained neurologic 
symptoms: a primer for physicians who make the initial encounter. The American journal of 

medicine, 128(10), 1059–1064. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.amjmed.2015.03.030 

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.chiabu.2017.01.011
https://psycnet.apa.org/doi/10.1191/1478088706qp063oa


 

Greco, M. (2012). The classification and nomenclature of “medically unexplained symptoms”: 
Conflict, performativity and critique. Social Science and Medicine, 75(12), 2362–2369. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.socscimed.2012.09.010 

Happell, B., Ewart, S. B., Bocking, J., Platania-Phung, C., & Stanton, R. (2016). “That red flag 
on your file”: misinterpreting physical symptoms as mental illness. Journal of Clinical 
Nursing, 25(19–20), 2933–2942. https://doi.org/10.1111/jocn.13355 

Happell, B., Scott, D., Platania-Phung, C., & Nankivell, J. (2012). Should we or shouldn’t we? 
Mental health nurses’ views on physical health care of mental health consumers. International 
Journal of Mental Health Nursing, 21(3), 202–210. https://doi.org/10.1111/j.1447-
0349.2011.00799.x 

Hefferon K, Gil-Rodriguez E. Interpretative phenomenological analysis. Psychologist. 
2011;24(10):756-759. doi:10.4324/9781315105246-7 

Jones, D. R., Macias, C., Barreira, P. J., Fisher, W. H., Hargreaves, W. A., & Harding, C. M. 
(2004). Prevalence, severity, and co-occurrence of chronic physical health problems of 
persons with serious mental illness. Psychiatric Services, 55(11), 1250–1257. 
https://doi.org/10.1176/appi.ps.55.11.1250 

Kiger ME, Varpio L. Thematic analysis of qualitative data: AMEE Guide. Med Teach 
2020;0(0):1–9. Available from: https://doi.org/10.1080/0142159X.2020.1755030 

Light D., Jr (1979). Uncertainty and control in professional training. Journal of health and social 

behavior, 20(4), 310–322. 

Link, B. G., Phelan, J. C., & Sullivan, G. (2017). Mental and physical health consequences of the 
stigma associated with mental illnesses. In The Oxford Handbook of Stigma, Discrimination, 
and Health (Issue November). https://doi.org/10.1093/oxfordhb/9780190243470.001.0001 

Löwe, B., Spitzer, R. L., Williams, J. B. W., Mussell, M., Schellberg, D., & Kroenke, K. (2008). 
Depression, anxiety and somatization in primary care: syndrome overlap and functional 
impairment. General Hospital Psychiatry, 30(3), 191–199. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.genhosppsych.2008.01.001 

Luyten, P., & Fonagy, P. (2020). Psychodynamic psychotherapy for patients with functional 
somatic disorders and the road to recovery. American Journal of Psychotherapy, 73(4), 125–
130. https://doi.org/10.1176/APPI.PSYCHOTHERAPY.20200010 

Malterud, K., Siersma, V. D., & Guassora, A. D. (2016). Sample Size in Qualitative Interview 
Studies: Guided by Information Power. Qualitative health research, 26(13), 1753–1760. 
https://doi.org/10.1177/1049732315617444 

Momen, N. C., Plana-Ripoll, O., Agerbo, E., Benros, M. E., Børglum, A. D., Christensen, M. K., 
Dalsgaard, S., Degenhardt, L., de Jonge, P., Debost, J.-C. P. G., Fenger-Grøn, M., Gunn, J. 
M., Iburg, K. M., Kessing, L. V., Kessler, R. C., Laursen, T. M., Lim, C. C. W., Mors, O., 
Mortensen, P. B., … McGrath, J. J. (2020). Association between Mental Disorders and 
Subsequent Medical Conditions. New England Journal of Medicine, 382(18), 1721–1731. 
https://doi.org/10.1056/nejmoa1915784 

Nelson, S., Baldwin, N., & Taylor, J. (2012). Mental health problems and medically unexplained 
physical symptoms in adult survivors of childhood sexual abuse: An integrative literature 

https://doi.org/10.1080/0142159X.2020.1755030


 

review. Journal of Psychiatric and Mental Health Nursing, 19(3), 211–220. 
https://doi.org/10.1111/j.1365-2850.2011.01772.x 

Nicolaidis, C., Curry, M. A., McFarland, B., & Gerrity, M. (2004). Violence, mental health, and 
physical symptoms in an academic internal medicine practice. Journal of General Internal 
Medicine, 19(8), 819–827. https://doi.org/10.1111/j.1525-1497.2004.30382.x 

Nielsen, G., Buszewicz, M., Edwards, M. J., & Stevenson, F. (2020). A qualitative study of the 
experiences and perceptions of patients with functional motor disorder. Disability and 
Rehabilitation, 42(14), 2043–2048. https://doi.org/10.1080/09638288.2018.1550685 

Paradies Y, Ben J, Denson N, et al. Racism as a determinant of health: a systematic review and 
meta-analysis. PLoS One. 2015;10:e0138511. https://doi.org/10.1371/journal.pone.0138511.  

Pescosolido BA, Medina TR, Martin JK, Long JS. The “backbone” of stigma: identifying the 
global core of public prejudice associated with mental illness. Am J Public Health. 
2013;103(5):853–60.  

Plana-Ripoll, O., Pedersen, C. B., Agerbo, E., Holtz, Y., Erlangsen, A., Canudas-Romo, V., 
Andersen, P. K., Charlson, F. J., Christensen, M. K., Erskine, H. E., Ferrari, A. J., Iburg, K. 
M., Momen, N., Mortensen, P. B., Nordentoft, M., Santomauro, D. F., Scott, J. G., Whiteford, 
H. A., Weye, N., … Laursen, T. M. (2019). A comprehensive analysis of mortality-related 
health metrics associated with mental disorders: A nationwide, Register-based Cohort Study. 
The Lancet, 394(10211), 1827–1835. https://doi.org/10.1016/s0140-6736(19)32316-5  

Rief, W., & Barsky, A. J. (2005). Psychobiological perspectives on somatoform disorders. 
Psychoneuroendocrinology, 30(10), 996–1002. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.psyneuen.2005.03.018 

Robson, D., & Gray, R. (2007). Serious mental illness and physical health problems: A 
discussion paper. International Journal of Nursing Studies, 44(3), 457–466. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijnurstu.2006.07.013 

Saunders, B., Sim, J., Kingstone, T., Baker, S., Waterfield, J., Bartlam, B., Burroughs, H., & 
Jinks, C. (2018). Saturation in qualitative research: exploring its conceptualization and 
operationalization. Quality & quantity, 52(4), 1893–1907. https://doi.org/10.1007/s11135-
017-0574-8 

Smith, J. A., & Shinebourne, P. (2012). Interpretative phenomenological analysis. In H. Cooper, 
P. M. Camic, D. L. Long, A. T. Panter, D. Rindskopf, & K. J. Sher (Eds.), APA handbook of 

research methods in psychology, Vol. 2. Research designs: Quantitative, qualitative, 

neuropsychological, and biological (pp. 73–82). American Psychological 
Association. https://doi.org/10.1037/13620-005 

Smith J, Flowers P, Larkin M. Interpretative Phenomenological Analysis: Theory, Research, 

Practice. London: SAGE; 2009. 

Stanley, I. M., Peters, S., & Salmon, P. (2002). A primary care perspective on prevailing 
assumptions about persistent medically unexplained physical symptoms. International Journal 
of Psychiatry in Medicine, 32(2), 125–140. https://doi.org/10.2190/AVM3-8GU8-JW70-
5RX5 

Van Hasselt, F. M., Oud, M. J., & Loonen, A. J. (2013). Improvement of care for the physical 
health of patients with severe mental illness: A qualitative study assessing the view of patients 

https://doi.org/10.1080/09638288.2018.1550685
https://psycnet.apa.org/doi/10.1037/13620-005


 

and families. BMC Health Services Research, 13(1). https://doi.org/10.1186/1472-6963-13-
426 

Van Sluijs, J. E. Van Der, Have, M. Ten, Rijnders, C., Van Marwijk, H., De Graaf, R., & Van 
Feltz-Cornelis, C. Der. (2015). Medically unexplained and explained physical symptoms in 
the general population: Association with prevalent and incident mental disorders. PLoS ONE, 
10(4), 1–14. https://doi.org/10.1371/journal.pone.0123274 

Watters, E. (2010). Crazy like us: The globalization of the American psyche. Free Press. 

Williams, D. R., Lawrence, J. A., Davis, B. A., & Vu, C. (2019). Understanding how 
discrimination can affect health. Health services research, 54 Suppl 2(Suppl 2), 1374–1388. 
https://doi.org/10.1111/1475-6773.13222 

 

https://doi.org/10.1371/journal.pone.0123274
https://doi.org/10.1111/1475-6773.13222


 

 
TABLE 1. 

Domain 

 

Manifestations 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Medical 
Management  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Theme 

 

The body can 
respond physically 
to mental states 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Physical symptoms 
can provide a 
facile explanation 
 
 
 
Medical providers 
can effectively 
incorporate mental 
wellbeing into 
treatment 

 

Representative Quote(s) 

 

I experienced just an overall like a sensation on my neck that was very hot 
and my body was experiencing this. I can't even describe what it was. I had 
weird pains in my arm. 
 
 
I wanted relief now because it was so freaking painful…physical pain, like 
when you're going in the throes of that, those meltdowns that I was in, there 
was a physical pain…it's like someone is reaching in and ripping out your 
soul, like that's what it felt like. 
 
My anxiety and my stress over my children cause me physical illness. 
 
 
 
I had Graves’ disease and they had to nuke my thyroid. I had a thyroid storm 
and I thought I was having a heart attack and they put me in the ambulance 
and they’re like, "Well, give her a milligram of Ativan.” 
 
 
 
I figured out that the back pain that I thought forever was fibromyalgia, is 
often just extreme tension in my body from having hyper vigilance from 
being an active person…I remember the first time my [physical] therapist 
suggested a grounding exercise and I was like, "Why the hell would I want 
to do that?" But it's important to be able to know what your body's telling 
you…it was very beneficial for me to be able to inhabit my body, you 
know? 
 
 
 
 

Disjointedness Separate mental 
and physical health 
treatment settings 
pose a challenge 
for all patients  

 
 

 

When he was in the psychiatric hospital…they were talking to him and he 
literally collapsed. And I mean, lost all physical functioning, including 
bladder and all that. So they knew that he had a seizure of some sort…So 
they rushed him by ambulance to another hospital, which was a medical 
hospital, not a psychiatric hospital…And they ran every test known to 
mankind…and they could find nothing physically wrong. I guess maybe by 
a process of elimination…they diagnosed him with pseudo seizure. 
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